
Privacy Policy 

Telesys Telekommunikationssysteme Gmbh (“following called 
“Telesys”) 

This privacy statement explains users on the nature, scope and purpose 
of the collection and use of personal data by the responsible provider 
Telesys on this website. 
The legal basis of data protection can be found in the Federal Data 
Protection Act (Act) and the Telemedia Act (TMG). 

Access data / server logfiles 

The provider (or his internet provider) collects data on each access to the 
website (so-called server log files). 
To access data includes: 
Name of the requested Web page, file, date and time of access, amount 
of data transferred, notification of successful retrieval, browser type 
along with version, the operating system of the user, referrer URL 
(previously visited), IP address and the requesting provider. 
The provider uses the data only for statistical purposes, for the purpose 
of operation, security and the optimization of the website. Vendor 
Maintains the right, however, the log information to check later if there is 
reasonable suspicion of unlawful use due to concrete indications. 

Contacting 

While contacting the seller (for example, using the contact form or e-
mail), the information of the user for the purpose of processing the 
request and in the event that connection questions arise stored. 
Integration of services and content of third parties 
It can happen that are integrated from other websites within this online 
website third party content, such as YouTube videos, maps from Google 
Maps, RSS feeds or graphics. This always assumes that the provider of 
such content (hereinafter referred to as "third-party") take the IP address 
the user true. Without the IP address, they cannot send to the browser of 
each user the content. The IP address is therefore necessary for the 
presentation of that content. We just strive to use content; their 
respective providers are using the IP address only to the delivery of 
content. However, we have no control over, if the third party's IP 
address, for example, Save for statistical purposes. Insofar as is known 
to us, we clarify the users about it on. 

Google Analytics 



This website uses Google Analytics, a web analytics service provided by 
Google Inc. („Google"). Google Analytics uses. "Cookies", text files which 
are stored on users' computers, to help analyze how users use the site 
through them. The information generated by the cookie about use of the 
website by the users are usually transmitted to a Google server in the 
USA and stored there. 
In case of activation of the IP anonymization on this website, the IP 
address of users of Google will be truncated within Member States of the 
European Union or other parties to the Agreement on the European 
Economic Area. Only in exceptional cases will the full IP address 
transferred to a Google server in the USA and shortened there. The IP-
anonymization is active on this website. On behalf of the operator of this 
website Google will use this information to evaluate the use of the site by 
users, to compile reports on website activity and providing other with 
website and internet related services to the website operator. 
Is undertaken as part of Google Analytics that your IP address will not be 
merged with other data from Google. The user may refuse the use of 
cookies by setting your browser software; However, this listing, the user 
indicates that you possibly can use to their full extent in this case not all 
features of this website. The user can also prevent the data generated by 
the cookie about your use of the website (incl. Your IP address) to 
Google and the processing of these data by Google, by the available at 
the following link browser plugin download and install: 
http://tools.google.com/dlpage/gaoptout?hl=de. 
As an alternative to browser add-on or within browsers on mobile 
devices, please click this link in order to avoid detection by Google 
Analytics on this website in the future. Here an opt-out cookie is stored 
on your device. Clear your cookies, you need to click this link again. 

Google AdSense 

This website uses Google AdSense, a service for including 
advertisements from Google Inc. („Google"). Google AdSense uses. 
"Cookies", text files that are stored on the computer of the user and the 
analysis of your use of the website allows. Google AdSense also uses 
so-called Web beacons (invisible images). Through this web beacons, 
information such as the visitor traffic can be analyzed on the pages of 
this website. 
The information generated by cookies and web beacons on this website 
(including the IP address of the user) and delivery of advertising formats 
are transmitted to a Google server in the USA and stored there. This 
information can be passed from Google to contractors of Google further. 
Google will not merge your IP address with other data stored by you. 



The user can prevent the installation of cookies by adjusting your 
browser software; However, the provider, the user indicates that they 
may not be able to use all features of this website to their full extent in 
this case. By using this site, users agree to the processing of data about 
you by Google in the manner described above and for the 
aforementioned purpose. 

Cancellation, changes, corrections and updates, 

The user has the right to information free of charge to get over the 
personal data that have been stored about him. In addition, the user has 
the right to correct inaccurate data, blocking and deletion of personal 
data, as far as the there is no legal obligation to retain. 
 


